

BID TABULATION

Project: 2018 Clarifier Recoating
 Engineer's Project Number: MF 11 Bid Deadline: March 13, 2018 at 2:00 p.m. local time

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF WORK	BID		Crane Engineering Kimberly, WI		Front Range Environmental McHenry, IL		MZ Construction, Inc. Livingston, WI	
		QUANT.	UNITS	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
BASE BID									
A-1.	Re-Coating Clarifiers No. 1, 2, and 3 in 2018	1	LS	\$ 195,000.00	\$ 195,000.00	\$ 221,000.00	\$ 221,000.00	\$ 229,000.00	\$ 229,000.00
ALTERNATE BID ITEMS									
B-1.	Re-Coating Clarifiers No. 1 and 3 in 2018; Coating Clarifier No. 2 in 2019	1	LS	\$ 205,000.00	\$ 205,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 222,000.00	\$ 222,000.00
B-2.	Letter of Performance Guarantee in Lieu of Performance Bond	1	LS	\$ (1,500.00)	\$ (1,500.00)	\$ (2,000.00)	\$ (2,000.00)		no bid
B-3.	Alternate Coating System	1	LS	\$ -	\$ -	\$ (5,000.00)	\$ (5,000.00)		no bid
B-4.	Pressure Wash of Aluminum Domes	1	LS	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00
	Time Required for Bid Item B-4		Days	5 Days Each (15 Total)		3 Days Each (9 Total)		10 Days Total	

BID TABULATION

Project: 2018 Clarifier Recoating
 Engineer's Project Number: MF 11 Bid Deadline: March 13, 2018 at 2:00 p.m. local time

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF WORK	BID		Omni Glass & Paint Oshkosh, WI		TMI Coatings, Inc. St. Paul, MN		Total Mechanical Services, Inc. St. Paul Park, MN	
		QUANT.	UNITS	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
BASE BID									
A-1.	Re-Coating Clarifiers No. 1, 2, and 3 in 2018	1	LS	\$ 295,200.00	\$ 295,200.00	\$ 635,000.00	\$ 635,000.00	\$ 710,000.00	\$ 710,000.00
ALTERNATE BID ITEMS									
B-1.	Re-Coating Clarifiers No. 1 and 3 in 2018; Coating Clarifier No. 2 in 2019	1	LS	\$ 299,400.00	\$ 299,400.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00
B-2.	Letter of Performance Guarantee in Lieu of Performance Bond	1	LS		no bid	\$ (3,000.00)	\$ (3,000.00)	\$ (5,500.00)	\$ (5,500.00)
B-3.	Alternate Coating System	1	LS		no bid	\$ 160,000.00	\$ 160,000.00	\$ (20,000.00)	\$ (20,000.00)
B-4.	Pressure Wash of Aluminum Domes	1	LS	\$ 12,400.00	\$ 12,400.00	\$ 76,000.00	\$ 76,000.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 22,000.00
	Time Required for Bid Item B-4		Days	13 Days Total		21 Days Total		14 Days Each	